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12.4 REPORT AND MINUTES OF THE AUDIT COMMITTEE MEETING HELD ON 4 MAY 2023 

Attachments: 1. Audit Committee Minutes - 4 May 2023   
2. Audit Log Attachments - Confidential    

  

RECOMMENDATION: 

That Council:  

1. RECEIVES the minutes of the Audit Committee Meeting of 4 May 2023, as at Attachment 1; and 

2. ENDORSES the remaining recommendations contained within the Audit Committee minutes of 

4 May 2023. 

 

PURPOSE OF REPORT: 

To report to Council the proceedings of the Audit Committee at its meeting held on 4 May 2023 in 
accordance with clause 2.21(1) of the City’s Meeting Procedures Local Law 2008. 

BACKGROUND: 

The City’s Audit Committee is a statutory committee of Council, established in accordance with Section 7.1A 
of the Local Government Act 1995. The role of the Audit Committee is to provide independent advice and 
assurance to Council over the City’s risk management, internal controls, legislative compliance and financial 
management. 
 
The Audit Committee meets approximately every two months and comprises of up to three external 
independent members (one of which is the Audit Committee Chair) and four Elected Members. 

DETAILS: 

The meeting agenda was managed by the Chairperson to accommodate external presenters in attendance 
and staff.  
 
5.1 OAG entrance meeting 2022/23 audit 
 
Representatives from the OAG attended to discuss the audit planning summary for the 2022/23 financial 
year. 
 
5.2 Budget Process and Carry Forwards  
 
The Chief Financial Officer made a presentation on the budget process. 
 
5.3 Internal Audit Program - Proposed Amendments to Incorporate Regulation 5 and 17 Review 
 Requirements  
 
Discussion took place around the audit program, and an amendment was proposed to update the program 
for year 2, to include the Regulation 5 and Regulation 17 audits only, and that consideration of all other 
internal audits be deferred until the following meeting. 
 
5.4 Audit Committee - Forward Agenda 2023  
 
Forward agenda was noted. 
 
5.5 Review of Audit Committee Terms of Reference  
 
This item was deferred to the June 2023 Audit Committee meeting as one of the Committee members had 
suggested amendments which are to be incorporated into the report.  It was also suggested that the name 
be changed to Audit and Risk Committee, and this will also be considered in the June 2023 report. 
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5.6 Office of the Auditor General - Information Systems Audit - Local Government 2021-22  
 
Discussion took place around this item, and the Executive Manager Information and Communication 
Technology agreed to request additional overlays (regional, metro and tier) from the OAG and present to the 
next meeting. 
 
5.7 Review of the City's Audit Log  
 
Discussion took place on the Audit Log and it was agreed that the Administration would invite Executive 
Manager Human Resources to the next Audit Committee meeting to provide an update on the electronic 
timesheet project and delivery date. 
 
6.  General Business  
 
It was suggested the pre-meeting held prior to the Audit Committee meeting be rescheduled to 4pm to allow 
all members to attend.  
 
A response to the question asked at the March 2023 meeting, during discussion on the Review of 
Purchasing Policy – Procurement item, has been included.   

CONSULTATION/ADVERTISING: 

Nil. 

LEGAL/POLICY: 

Clause 2.21 of the City’s Meeting Procedures Local Law 2008 states that the reports and minutes of a 
Committee meeting are to be provided to Council. 
 
The Audit Committee Terms of Reference govern the functions, powers and membership of the Audit 
Committee. 

RISK MANAGEMENT IMPLICATIONS: 

Low: It is low risk for Council to consider the report and minutes of the Audit Committee meeting on 4 May 
2023. 

STRATEGIC IMPLICATIONS: 

This is in keeping with the City’s Strategic Community Plan 2018-2028: 
 
Innovative and Accountable 

Our resources and assets are planned and managed in an efficient and sustainable manner. 

We are open and accountable to an engaged community. 

FINANCIAL/BUDGET IMPLICATIONS: 

Nil.
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